

THOMPSON AND LLEWELLYN, P.A.

P.O. Box 818
 Fort Smith, Arkansas 72902
 479/785-2867

Fed. ID. # 71-0574486

September 1, 2015



Fort Smith School District
 Attn: Dr. Benny Gooden, Supt.
 P.O. Box 1948
 Fort Smith, AR 72902-1948

		Hours	Amount
8/1/15	63441 - FOIA JML Research legal authorities on issues raised in complaint.	2.00	400.00
8/3/15	JML Conference with Y. Keaton-Martin.	0.70	140.00
	JML Telephone conference with D. Mehl to schedule deposition.	0.20	40.00
	JML Receipt and review correspondence from Attorney McCutchen.	0.20	40.00
	JML Draft correspondence to Dr. Gooden.	0.20	40.00
8/4/15	JML Receipt and review correspondence from J. McCutchen.	0.20	40.00
	JML Telephone conference with J. Cole.	0.20	40.00
	JML Preparation for conference with R. Owens, conference with R. Owens.	1.30	260.00
	JML Preparation for and conference with J. Cole.	0.90	180.00
	JML Receipt and review correspondence from McCutchen office.	0.20	40.00
8/5/15	JML Preparation for conference with Dr. Mehl.	0.30	60.00
	JML Conference with Dr. Mehl.	0.80	160.00
	JML Telephone conference with S. McFerran.	0.20	40.00
	JML Telephone conference with Dr. Gooden	0.20	40.00
	JML Telephone conference with Z Featherston.	0.20	40.00

September 1, 2015

			Hours	Amount
8/5/15	JML	Telephone conference with R. Owen.	0.20	40.00
	JML	Telephone conference with S. McFerran.	0.20	40.00
	JML	Telephone conference with R. Owen.	0.20	40.00
8/6/15	JML	Conference with Z. Featherston.	0.50	100.00
	JML	Conference with Dr. Gooden.	0.50	100.00
8/10/15	JML	Prepare for and attend depositions of Ms. Z. Featherston, Ms. Y. Keaton-Martin, Mr. R. Owens, R. Wade, Esq., Dr. D. Mehl, Dr. D. Hunton, Ms. S. McFerran, and Ms. J. Cole; telephone conference with Judge Cox and opposing counsel initiated by opposing counsel during depositions.	12.00	2,400.00
8/11/15	JML	Receipt and review motion to quash subpoena re J. Ketcham.	0.30	60.00
	JML	Receipt and review response to motion.	0.30	60.00
	JML	Telephone conference with Attorney Wade and Dr. Gooden.	0.40	80.00
8/13/15	JML	Telephone conference with Dr. Gooden.	0.20	40.00
	JML	Telephone conference with Dr. Mehl.	0.20	40.00
	JML	Receipt and review order quashing subpoena.	0.20	40.00
	JML	Work on motion and brief.	0.80	160.00
8/14/15	JML	Research issue regarding attorney contacting parties known to be represented by counsel.	1.00	200.00
8/16/15	JML	Review 2nd amended complaint; review Ark. Rules of Civil Procedure.	0.70	140.00
8/17/15	JML	Research rules, statutes and cases on legal issues.	2.00	400.00
	JML	Telephone conference with Mrs. Keaton-Martin; telephone conference with Rick Wade; telephone conference with Deanie Mehl; telephone conference with Jeanie Cole.	0.80	160.00
	WPT	Worked on draft of answer to second amended complaint.	2.30	460.00

B26

September 1, 2015

			Hours	Amount
8/18/15	JML	Draft preliminary outline for summary judgment motion; research legal issues.	3.30	660.00
	WPT	Worked on draft of answer to second amended complaint and motion and brief for summary judgment.	6.00	1,200.00
8/19/15	WPT	Worked on Answer to second amended complaint; worked on motion and brief in support of summary judgment.	4.50	900.00
	JML	Conference with Rick Wade.	0.30	60.00
	JML	Draft affidavit.	0.40	80.00
	JML	Receipt and review motion for extension of time.	0.50	100.00
	JML	Prepare for and conference with Mrs. Keaton-Martin re affidavit.	1.00	200.00
	JML	Research legal authorities for motion for summary judgment.	2.50	500.00
8/20/15	WPT	Worked on motion and brief for summary judgment and affidavits and exhibits in support of the motion; worked on response in opposition to plaintiff's motion for extension of discovery deadline.	7.00	1,400.00
	JML	Prepare for and conference with Jeannie Cole re affidavit.	0.70	140.00
	JML	Prepare for and conference with Deanie Mehl re affidavit.	0.80	160.00
8/21/15	WPT	Worked on motion and brief in support of summary judgment.	2.50	500.00
	JML	Telephone conferences with N. Brooks and Dr. Gooden re minutes of 7/27 board meeting.	0.40	80.00
	JML	Conference with Dr. Gooden.	0.50	100.00
8/25/15	WPT	Receipt and review minutes of 7/27/15 school board meeting; attached to motion for summary judgment as Exhibit 12 and caused same to be assembled, filed and served on opposing counsel.	0.60	120.00

September 1, 2015

			Hours	Amount
8/26/15	WPT	Receipt and review reply of plaintiff in support of his motion to extend discovery and depose Dr. Gooden, et al; telephone conference with Dr. Gooden; forwarded copy of reply to Dr. Gooden.	0.80	160.00
8/31/15	JML	Receipt and review email from Attorney McCutchen.	0.20	40.00
	JML	Research AG Opinions.	0.50	100.00
	JML	Receipt and review correspondence from Attorney McCutchen.	0.20	40.00
	JML	Draft response to McCutchen.	0.10	20.00
	JML	Receipt and review request for information from J. McCutchen.	0.20	40.00
	WPT	Review and analysis of plaintiffs' prayer for relief and authorities dealing with remedies available under FOIA.	3.00	600.00
<i>[Subtotal:</i>			<i>66.60</i>	<i>13,320.00]</i>
			<hr/>	<hr/>
For professional services rendered			66.60	\$13,320.00
Expense charges				
8/6/15	63441 - FOIA	Official Court Reporter / Transcript of July 29 Hearing		373.10
<i>[Subtotal:</i>				<i>373.10]</i>
Total costs				<hr/> \$373.10
Total time and expense charges				<hr/> \$13,693.10
Previous balance				\$8,106.00
8/17/15	Payment received			(\$8,106.00)
Balance due				<hr/> <hr/> \$13,693.10

*Approved 9-2-15
B. Smith*